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Charles A. Alutto is President and Chief Executive Officer of Stericycle, Inc. Charlie 
oversees the strategic direction of the $3.6 billion services company based out of Lake 
Forest, Illinois. With more than 25,500 employees in the U.S. and 21 countries, Stericycle 
is a global leader in outsourced business-to-business services including regulated waste 
services; compliance training; secure information destruction; live voice and automated 
communication services; and product recall and retrievals.

Prior to being named CEO in January of 2013, Charlie served in several leadership 
roles at Stericycle. His career with the company began in 1997; Charlie had served as 
an Area Vice President of Sales for a company acquired by Stericycle. From there he 
moved into roles as Vice President of Healthcare Sales and Marketing, Vice President 
and Managing Director of Stericycle Europe, and President of Stericycle US Healthcare 
Compliance Solutions.

Before joining Stericycle, Charlie spent nine years with the New York-based 
Environmental Control Company. He started his career as a sales representative and 
progressed to Director of Sales and Marketing. 

Charlie was named to the 2014 Institutional Investor Magazine All American Executive 
Team (ranked #3 CEO for Business, Education and Professional Services – Buy Side) 
and one of “75 People to Know in Chicago Healthcare” by Becker’s Hospital Review. 
He is a member of CEO Connection and CEO’s Against Cancer. In addition to his role 
on the Stericycle Board of Directors, Charlie serves on the Foundation Board of the 
Rehabilitation Institute of Chicago and on the Advisory Board of the Providence College 
Business School. In 2017, Charlie became a Director for Consolidated Infrastructure 
Group, a private company based in Omaha, Nebraska.

A native of New York, Charlie earned a Bachelor’s of Science degree in finance from 
the Providence College in 1988 and Masters of Business Administration from Saint 
John’s University in 1991. Charlie is married with four children. He enjoys skiing, golf, 
and platform tennis.


